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18th June Schedule

9am - Registration 

9.15am - Departure

10.15am - Briefing  Lin-gang Special Area of

the China (Shanghai) Pilot Free Trade Zone

12.30pm - Lunch 

13.30 - Departure

14.30 - Briefing - Shanghai Waigaoqiao Free Trade Zone

16.30 - Return to Venue Hotel

Shanghai Waigaoqiao Free Trade Zone
Shanghai Waigaoqiao Free Trade Zone,
whose establishment was approved by the
State Council in June 1990, is the earliest and
largest Free Trade Zone in China, which
integrates such economic functions as free
trade, export processing, logistics and
warehousing, and duty-free commodities
exhibition and trading, with the planning area
of 10 square kilometers, 6.4 square 
 kilometers of which have been developed for
operation thus far.
 
After a decade’s development and
construction, as of the end of 2000, the Free
Trade Zone had accumulatively approved
4,383 investment projects and attracted total
investment of USD5.351 billion from 58
countries and regions across the world.
 
REGISTER:
globaltrade@kwconfex.com

Lingang Special Area of the China
(Shanghai) Pilot Free Trade
The development of Lin-gang Special Area is
to start with Nanhui New Town, Lin-gang
Equipment Industrial Zone, Xiaoyangshan
Island and the southern part of Shanghai
Pudong International Airport, etc. Lin-gang
Special Area is located in the Southeast of
Shanghai, with Shanghai Pudong
International Airport on its north and
Yangshan International Port on its south. It is
an important node on Shanghai Coastal
thoroughfare. Waterways, air routes, railways,
highways, inland rivers and subway constitute
a very convenient integrated transportation
system, which is a big advantage of Lin-gang
Special Area. The Special Area will establish a
relatively institutional system featuring the
liberalization and facilitation of investment
and trade, set up functional platforms with
higher openness, and enabled the area to
become a business cluster world-class
enterprises. 


